
Middle Bucks Institute of Technology 

Weekly Lesson Plan for the week of: 12-6-21     Level 100 

 
Program:  MHP                    Teacher: Mrs. Moyer 

 
Day                 Content 

From PDE POS 

PA 
Core  
Standards 

       Skills/Objectives 
Demonstrate knowledge of….. 

Activities 
Using these methods to learn… 

       Assessment 
                How will I be evaluated? 

 
Monday 

Task#: 1008/ 812/ 1202 
Intro to Digestive 
System 
Identify Structures and 
functions of digestive 
system using pictures 
and anatomical model 
  
 
 
 

 
CC 3.5 9-
10 A, B, D 
 
CC 3.6 9-
10 A, B, E, 
F  
 

List and identify each 
structure of the digestive 
system and its function, 
locate on anatomical model 
and sim-cadaver 
Perform Denture care per PA 
NA guidelines 

Lecture 
Handouts 
Skeletal notes 
Instructional videos 
Demonstration 
Return demonstration 
 

 
Daily Employability grade 
 

Skill practice with peer 
evaluation  
 

Pancreas article  

 

 
Tuesday 

 
 
 

Task#: 1008/ 812/ 1202 
Continue lower GI: 
Identify Structures and 
functions of digestive 
system using pictures 
and anatomical model 
  
 
 
 

 
CC 3.5 9-
10 B, C, 
D 
CC 3.6 9-
10 A, D, F  

List and identify each 
structure of the digestive 
system and its function, 
locate on anatomical model 
Perform Denture care per PA 
state NA guidelines  
 
 

Lecture 
Handouts 
Skeletal notes 
Instructional videos 
Demonstration 
Return demonstration 
 

Daily Employability grade 
 

Skill practice / test Denture 
care 
 

H-J list abbreviations due  
 
  

 
Wednesday 

Task#: 1008/ 1202/ 812 
Discuss conscious vs. 
unconscious mouth care 
Epiglottis function 
Positioning 
Equipment use and infection 
control  

 
CC3.5 9-
10 A, B, C, 
D,  
 
CC 3.6 9-
10 D, E, I 

Perform Denture care per 
Nurse Aide guidelines  
Discuss Digestive changes 
that occur with neurological 
disorders 
Introduction to conscious 
mouth care 

PPT 
Lecture 
Handouts 
Demo 
Return Demonstration 
Independent study 

 
Daily Employability grade 
 

Skill assessments Denture 
care 
Peer eval: Conscious mouth 
care 

 
Thursday 

 Task#:  1008/ 812/ 1202 
Visually represent anatomy  
and physiology of Digestive 
system  
Functions of all structures  
Alimentary canal  
Accessory organs  

  

Research and report in 
PPT format on one 
specific GI disorder 
following teacher supplied 
rubric  
Perform conscious mouth 
care per Nurse Aide 
guidelines in lab  
  

Independent computer research  
Application of knowledge  
Computer skills   
Demonstration of skill according to rubric  
HOSA officer meeting  

 

 
CC3.5 9-
10 A, B, C, 
E, G 
 
CC 3.6 9-
10 E, F, I  
 

Create clay 3-D model of 
complete Digestive system, 
label and provide function for 
each structure  
Collaborate with group 
members  

PPT 
Lecture 
Handouts 
Demo 
Return Demonstration 
Independent lab practice  

Daily Employability 
 
Completion of Digestive 
system model  
 
Quizlet abbreviations  
 
 
 
 
  

 

 
Friday 

Task# 1008/ /812  
 
GI Diseases and disorders 
including cause, risk factors, 
symptoms, treatment, and 

associated pictures  
 

 CC3.5 9-
10 A, B, G 
 
CC 3.6 9-
10 D, E, F, 
I  

 

 

Research and prepare PPT 
format on one specific GI 
disorder following teacher 
supplied rubric  
Continue progress on 
conscious mouth care 
assessment  

Lecture/   
Handout/ PPT  
Group discussion  
Demonstration  
Return Demonstration  
Independent research   

  
Daily Employability  
  
H-J list abbreviations Quiz  
 
Progress on independent 
project 

 


